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Year 5 English —Spring 1 

 
Writing Outcome ;To write a myth: to create characters (heroes, villains and monsters) and set-
tings. 

Developing Vocabulary 

Ravines - a deep, narrow 
gorge with steep sides.  

Molten -  liquefied by heat.  

Embers - a small piece of 
burning or glowing coal or 
wood in a dying fire.  

Townsfolk - another term for 
townspeople 

Meddler - a person who med-
dles in the affairs of others.  

Fjord - a long, narrow, deep 
inlet of the sea between high 
cliffs, as in Norway, typically 
formed by submergence of a 
glaciated valley.  

Warrior - a brave or experi-
enced soldier or fighter. 

Cauldron - a large metal pot 
with a lid and handle, used 
for cooking over an open fire.  

Talon - the claw of an animal 
and especially of a bird of 
prey. 

Elements - strong winds, 
heavy rain, or other kinds of 
bad weather. 

Gravely - to a degree that 
gives cause for alarm  

 Ravaged - severely damaged; 
devastated  

 Realms - a field or domain of 
activity or interest  

Additional Text covered 

Punctuation and Grammar 

Non-negotiables 

 Use punctuation at Y4 standard cor-

rectly (full stops, capital letters, excla-

mation marks, question marks, com-

mas in a list, commas after fronted 

adverbials, apostrophes for contrac-

tion and possession)  

 Link ideas across paragraphs using 

adverbials  

 Use of inverted commas and other 

punctuation to punctuate    direct 

speech (Y4)  

Year 5 Expectations 

 Vary story openings: start with       

dialogue, action or description  

 Use paragraphs to vary pace and     

emphasis  

 Use dialogue to move action forward  

 Create a plot: a journey, a quest or a 

series of trials for the hero  

 Create characters which behave in 

superhuman ways with unusual     

powers or strong characteristics  

 Create a magic object which may 

symbolise something  
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